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30 January 2024  
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
I am writing in response to your request for information made under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 in relation to Induction of Labour. 
 
You asked: All questions are shown as received by the Trust. 
1. Number of births 2022-23  
2. Number of births 2021-22  
3. Number of births 2020-21  
4. Number of births 2019-20 
5. Number of inductions 2022-23  
6. Number of inductions 2021-22  
7. Number of inductions 2020-21  
8. Number of inductions 2019-20 
9. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2022-23  
10. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2021-22  
11. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2020-21  
12. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2019-20 
13. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay 
of 2 hours or more between admission for induction and beginning of the 
process in 2022-23  
14. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay 
of 2 hours or more between admission for induction and beginning of the 
process in 2021-22  
15. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay 
of 2 hours or more between admission for induction and beginning of the 
process in 2020-21  
16. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay 
of 2 hours or more between admission for induction and beginning of the 
process in 2019-20 
 

http://www.mtw.nhs.uk/


Trust response: 
1. 5708 
2. 5746 
3. 5538 
4. 5516 
5. 1655 
6. 1585 
7. 1349 
8. 1327 
9, 10, 11 & 12.  
Financial Year Number of Incidents 

2019/2020 2 

2020/2021 6 

2021/2022 3 

2022/2023  2 

Total 13 

13. Not recorded during this time period 
14. Not recorded during this time period 
15. Not recorded during this time period 
16. Not recorded during this time period 
 


