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Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
I am writing in response to your request for information made under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 in relation to asylum seekers. 
 
You asked: All questions are shown as received by the Trust. 
1. How many refused asylum seekers hold NHS debt in your trust?  
2. How many female refused asylum seekers hold NHS debt in your 
trust?  
3. How many female refused asylum seekers hold NHS debt due to 
accessing maternity care on the NHS in your trust?  
4. What is the total amount of NHS debt refused asylum seekers hold in 
GBP in your trust?  
5. What is the total amount of NHS debt female refused asylum seekers 
hold in GBP in your trust?  
6. What is the total amount of NHS debt female refused asylum seekers 
hold due to accessing maternity care on the NHS in GBP in your trust?   
 
Trust response: 
Please note: The Trust does not hold separate information on Asylum 
Seekers. We will charge people who are not entitled, however we cannot 
separate them into categories.  
1. We do not hold this information. 
2. We do not hold this information. 
3. We do not hold this information. 
4. We do not hold this information. 
5. We do not hold this information. 
6. We do not hold this information. 
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