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Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
I am writing in response to your request for information made under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 in relation to Obstetric data for last 5 years. 
 
You asked:  
Please can you give figures for each of the last 5 years i.e. 2018-2022 
1. Total live births 
2. Total still births 
3. Total intrapartum still births 
4. Total neonatal deaths to 28 days 
5. Total preterm births (<37 weeks) 
6. Total maternal deaths 
7. Total maternal collapses / cardiac arrests 
8. Total postpartum haemorrhage >1.5l 
9. Evacuation of retained products of conception (ERPCs) 
10. Attendance numbers for early pregnancy clinics 
11. Do you record covid-19 vaccination status in your electronic maternity 
records? 
12. If possible for 2021 & 2022 could you give all of the above data by covid 
vaccination status (0/1/2/3/4 doses) or state if you do not record vaccination 
status. 
 
Trust response: 
Please note:  XX - Under Section 12 of the Act the Trust does not hold this 
information in a reportable format. It may be possible that this information has 
been entered into a patients record but in order to confirm this each patient 
record would need to be manually checked by a clinical staff member.  The 
Trust has estimated that it will cost more than the appropriate limit to consider 
this part of your request.  The appropriate limit is specified in regulations and 
represents the estimated cost of one person spending 3½ working days in 

http://www.mtw.nhs.uk/


determining whether the Trust holds the information, locating, retrieving and 
extracting the information.   
  

2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

1 6064 5616 5540 6003 5585 

2 9 16 11 18 19 

3 0 1 1 1 0 

4 2 3 2 4 1 

5 343 364 334 348 399 

6 0 2 0 4 1 

7 XX XX XX XX XX 

8 202 176 169 154 173 

9 43 37 34 49 52 

10 2356 2119 2579 2676 2588 

11 Not applicable Not applicable Not applicable XX XX 

12 Not applicable Not applicable Not applicable XX XX 

 
 


