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Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
I am writing in response to your request for information made under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 in relation to rodent pest control. 
 
You asked:  
1. How many times pest control has been called out by your Trust for EACH 
year for instances of rodents (rats or mice) for 2017, 2018. 2019, 2020, 2021, 
2022. 
2. Please provide information on how much was spent per annum on pest 
control for these call outs for rodents (rats or mice) for 2017, 2018, 2019, 
2020, 2021, 2022. 
 
Trust response: 
1. 

2017-2018 2019-2020 2021-2022 

7 4 18 

The Trust does not hold this level of detailed information. These figures have 
been provided by the pest control company in the format that they hold them. 
 
2. The Trust does not hold this level of detailed information. This information is 
held by the pest control company. 
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