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| am writing in response to your request for information made under the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 in relation to Star House, Pudding Lane,
Maidstone.

You asked:

1, total calls made to the emergency services since 2013 which has resulted
in at least one ambulance or paramedic vehicle attending this address?

In each case please the outcome for the patient might include details of the
following:

i) Treatment at the scene.

i) Admission to hospital.

i) death.

2, How many (if any) deaths have been recorded in relation to these buildings
since 2013?

This includes the number of people who;

i)Have died within the address.

i)a. Any people who have fallen ill at this address and b. later died in hospital.
iif) Any people who have died elsewhere but resided at this address.

I’'m aware that in attempting to answer some of these questions the trust may
have to pass this request on to other NHS organisations. I'm happy to consent
to this in advance.

Trust response:

1. Having reviewed your request for information | confirm that Maidstone &
Tunbridge Wells NHS Trust does not hold the information falling within the
description specified in your request. We have identified that, due to the
nature of the information that you are seeking, your request would be more
appropriately addressed to: South East Coast Ambulance Service.

i) Having reviewed your request for information | confirm that Maidstone &
Tunbridge Wells NHS Trust does not hold the information falling within the



description specified in your request. We have identified that, due to the
nature of the information that you are seeking, your request would be more
appropriately addressed to: South East Coast Ambulance Service.

i) Having reviewed your request for information | confirm that Maidstone &
Tunbridge Wells NHS Trust does not hold the information falling within the
description specified in your request. We have identified that, due to the
nature of the information that you are seeking, your request would be more
appropriately addressed to: South East Coast Ambulance Service.

iif) Having reviewed your request for information | confirm that Maidstone &
Tunbridge Wells NHS Trust does not hold the information falling within the
description specified in your request. We have identified that, due to the
nature of the information that you are seeking, your request would be more
appropriately addressed to: South East Coast Ambulance Service.

2. The Trust does not hold this information.

1) The Trust does not hold this information.

i) a. The Trust does not hold this information. b. Zero

iif) The Trust does not hold this information.



