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Maidstone  
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ME16 9QQ 

Email: mtw-tr.foiadmin@nhs.net 
7 November 2018 
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
I am writing in response to your request for information made under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 in relation to Sessional GP’s in leadership 
positions across the Kent and Medway STP. 
 
You asked: 
1. The number of people on your governing body/board 
2. The number of voting members on your governing body/board 
3. The number of GPs on your governing body/board 
4. The number of GPs on your governing body/board who are voting members 
5. The number of salaried GPs on your governing body/board 
6. The number of locum GPs on your governing body/board 
7. If there are no salaried or locum GPs on the governing body/board, any 
clauses in the constitution that, in effect, bar locum and/or salaried GPs from 
the STPs governing body/board 
8. The number of salaried GPs who hold a clinical lead position 
9. The number of locum GPs who hold a clinical lead position 
10. The number of people on your Clinical Senate or the equivalent of the 
clinical executive committee 
11. The number of GPs on your Clinical Senate or the equivalent of the 
clinical executive committee 
12. The number of salaried and locum GPs on your Clinical Senate or the 
equivalent of the clinical executive committee 
13. The number of locum GPs on your Clinical Senate or the equivalent of the 
clinical executive committee 
14. If there are no salaried or locum GPs on the Clinical Senate or the 
equivalent of the clinical executive committee, any clauses in the constitution 
that, in effect, bar locum and/or salaried GPs from the Clinical Senate or the 
equivalent of the clinical executive committee 
 
STP response: 
1. There are 28 members on the Kent and Medway Sustainability and 
Transformation Partnership (STP) Programme board. 
 



2. All members are able to vote at the Programme Board; however statutory 
decision-making sits with the individual NHS health, social care and public 
health organisations which constitute the STP.  
 
3. There are three GPs on the STP Programme Board.  
 
4. All members are able to vote at the Programme Board; however statutory 
decision-making sits with the individual NHS health, social care and public 
health organisations which constitute the STP.  
 
5. Kent and Medway STP does not hold this information. Please contact 
partnership organisations directly for information on their employee contracts.  
 
6. Kent and Medway STP does not hold this information. Please contact 
partnership organisations directly for information on their employee contracts.  
 
7. There are there are no policies in place that prohibit salaried / locum GPs 
from the STP governing groups.  
 
8. Kent and Medway STP does not hold this information. Please contact 
partnership organisations directly for information on their employee contracts.  
 
9. Kent and Medway STP does not hold this information. Please contact 
partnership organisations directly for information on their employee contracts.  
 
10. There are 31 members of the Kent and Medway STP Clinical and 
Professional Board. 
 
11. There are nine GPs on the Kent and Medway STP Clinical and 
Professional Board. 
 
12. Kent and Medway STP does not hold this information. Please contact 
partnership organisations directly for information on their employee contracts.  
 
13. Kent and Medway STP does not hold this information. Please contact 
partnership organisations directly for information on their employee contracts.  
 
14. There are there are no policies in place that prohibit salaried/locum GPs 
from the STP oversight groups. 
 


